
HOUSE RULES 

 

1. Acceptance of Rules   
   Entering the premises where the Historalia event (hereinafter referred to as the 
"Premises") is taking place implies that each attendee, including those not attending the 
performance, has read and accepted these house rules (hereinafter referred to as the 
"Rules") without reservation and will comply with them. The Rules can be reviewed at the 
event location and on the website https://www.historalia.co.uk/. 
 

2. On the Premises   
   2.1. Every visitor presenting themselves at the entrance (entry point of the Premises) must 
possess a valid ticket. The ticket grants one-time access to the specific performance. Visitors 
must only occupy the seat allocated to them by the entrance staff. Each person on the 
Premises must always have a valid ticket until they leave the Premises.   
   2.2. Every visitor must behave responsibly. Any person who damages individuals, property, 
buildings, and/or other materials belonging to the event organiser (Historalia UK Ltd., with 
registered office at Lakeside Oast, TN16 1PW, company number 15189229 (hereinafter 
“Historalia”)) or other third parties will be held fully liable for all damage, including 
consequential damage.   
   2.3. Historalia reserves the right to deny access to the Premises to individuals (i) who are 
evidently under the influence of alcohol, drugs, or any other stimulants; (ii) who manifestly 
demonstrate behaviour that could disrupt public order or incite violence, hatred, anger, or 
racism towards other attendees, performers, or other persons involved in the event, or 
towards Historalia staff; (iii) who have been banned from the Premises by Historalia or 
administrative or judicial authorities; or (iv) who generally do not comply with one or more 
provisions of these Rules. Historalia reserves the right to remove such persons from the 
Premises for the reasons listed above. If Historalia refuses entry to the Premises or removes 
an individual from the Premises for safety reasons, Historalia is not obliged to refund the 
ticket.   
   2.4. Taking photographs during the performance is allowed provided that the recordings 
are not made with professional equipment and that commercial use of these recordings is 
strictly prohibited, as it constitutes an infringement of intellectual property rights, including 
those of Historalia. Only if the aforementioned conditions are strictly adhered to may 
recordings be published on social media. Filming is subject to the same conditions, with the 
stipulation that recordings must not exceed 2 minutes, which also applies to audio 
recordings.   
   2.5. The following items are prohibited from being brought onto the Premises; this list is 
not exhaustive:   
   - Alcohol, bottles, glasses, cans, drugs, and/or stimulants; projectiles or explosives in any 
state; flammable products or substances, aerosol cans;   
   - Recording equipment (photo, video, and audio);   
   - Snacks (including drinks and chewing gum) and other food items not purchased on the 
Premises;   
   - (Foldable) bicycles, roller skates, skateboards, etc.;   
   - Any weapon or dangerous, sharp, or blunt object that could be used as such; or   
   - Any other items that could be used to disrupt order, endanger visitor safety, or cause 
damage to property and individuals.   



   Historalia and/or its authorised personnel may request the surrender of such items. Access 
to the Premises will be denied to anyone who refuses to surrender such items.   
   2.6. Animals are not allowed on the Premises. However, guide dogs are permitted.   
   2.7. Individuals entering the Premises may be filmed, and the footage may be recorded 
and stored. This recording and storage of footage is solely for the purpose of maintaining 
and ensuring safety on the Premises.   
   2.8. On the Premises, it is strictly prohibited for any visitor to:   
   - Enter non-public areas of the Premises;   
   - Obstruct access and evacuation routes, stairs, stairwells, and galleries, and to remain in 
such places longer than strictly necessary; and   
   - Disrupt order, compromise the comfort and/or safety of the public by, for example, being 
noisy, using mobile phones and other multimedia devices during the performance, placing 
feet on seatbacks, throwing food items, etc.   
   2.9. Visitors must dispose of paper waste, cups, and other trash in the designated bins for 
the cleanliness of the Premises and in compliance with waste sorting regulations.   
   2.10. Commercial activities of any kind are strictly prohibited on the Premises and 
associated infrastructure, such as parking areas, without prior written permission from 
Historalia.   
   2.11. Under the Licensing Act 2003, alcohol must not be sold to anyone under the age of 
18. Historalia and its staff have the right to request proof of age from anyone wishing to 
purchase alcohol. 
 

3. Parking   
   3.1. Drivers are requested to park their vehicles in the designated parking areas around the 
Premises (unless specific parking arrangements are provided by Historalia). They should lock 
their vehicles carefully and ensure that no valuable items are left visible. Historalia is not 
responsible for any theft and/or damage or personal injury. 
 

4. Safety   
   4.1. For safety reasons and/or other similar reasons, Historalia reserves the right to:   
   - Interrupt or stop the performance;   
   - Evacuate the Premises wholly or partially;   
   - Remove visitors who do not comply with the Rules from the Premises.   
   In the event of an evacuation, visitors must strictly follow the instructions given by 
Historalia, its appointed staff, or third parties.   
   4.2. Historalia cannot be held liable for any damage, loss, theft, or personal injury. 
Historalia also cannot be held liable for the consequences of breaches or intentional 
misconduct by its staff or agents.   
   4.3. Historalia reserves the right to conduct surveillance in accordance with applicable 
legislation. 
 

5. Sanctions   
   5.1. The possible sanction for those who violate the Rules is temporary suspension of 
access rights, potentially without refund of the ticket. Continued breaches of the Rules may 
lead to permanent exclusion of the visitor.   
   5.2. In the event of a breach of the Rules, the police may be involved if necessary, with a 
possible report being filed.   



   5.3. Historalia also reserves the right to claim £25 from anyone who breaches one or more 
provisions of the Rules, without prejudice to the right to claim full compensation for 
damages. 
 

 

 

 


